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500

Can communicate very fluently and 
effectively with patients and health pro-
fessionals using appropriate register, 
tone and lexis. Shows complete unders-
tanding of any kind of written or spoken 
language.

Can communicate effectively with pa-
tients and health professionals using 
appropriate register, tone and lexis. With 
only occasional inaccuracies and hesita-
tions. Shows good understanding in a 
range of clinical contexts.

Can maintain the interaction in a relevant 
healthcare enviroment despite occasional 
errors and lapses, and follow standard 
spoken language normally encountered in 
his/her field of specialisation.

Can maintain some interaction and un-
derstand straightforward factual infor-
mation in his/her field of specialisation, 
but may ask for clarification. Frequent 
errors, inaccuracies and mis-or overuse 
of technical language can cause strain in 
communication.

Can manage simple interaction on fami-
liar topics and understand the main point 
in short, simple messages, provided 
he/she can ask for clarification. High den-
sity of errors and mis- or overuse of tech-
nical language can cause significant strain 
and breakdowns in communication.
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